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Information requested: 
 
Please provide figures and information for the time period starting from when the UK vaccine-
roll out began in December 2020 - Present.  
  
1. The total number of single Covid-19 vaccine doses administered by all health 

authorities within your trust each month, broken down by manufacturer, e.g. 
AstraZeneca, Pfizer and Moderna.  
 

2. The total number of single vaccine doses that have been wasted or discarded at 
vaccine hubs controlled by your trust each month, broken down by manufacturer, 
e.g. AstraZeneca, Pfizer and Moderna.  
 

3. Please state the reasons for this wastage or discarding, e.g. dropped or 
contaminated vials; human error in the preparation process; expired stock; leftover 
doses; and faulty syringes. 

 
 
Response: 
 
1. 

1.  
  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
2.  The records that we hold about the vaccination programme do not record 

information about   vaccine wastage and therefore we give notice under Section 17 
of FOISA that we do not hold this information. We estimate wastage to be less 
than 3%. 

 
3. As part of the vaccination programme The State Hospital would have needed to 

complete paperwork for any vaccine wastage except when it was caused by 
leftover doses. As we hold no records of any reasons for vaccine wastage, any 
wastage was due to leftover doses. 

 
 
 

  Pfizer Astrazeneca Moderna Totals 
Dec-20 179 0 0 179 
Jan-21 334 0 0 334 
Feb-21 0 36 0 36 
Mar-21 498 101 0 599 
Apr-21 0 19 0 19 
May-21 4 90 0 94 
Jun-21 0 8 0 8 
Jul-21 8 0 0 8 
Aug-21 0 0 0 0 
Totals 1023 254 0 1277 
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