
Request Reference: FOI/039/21 
Published: 28 February 2022 

Information requested: 
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act regarding your 
organisation's Private Patient Third Party Involvement. Please can you complete the attached 
questions. 
1. Does the organisation receive private patient income from third parties? For example for
delivery of private patient services, for renting of space, through a commercial agreement etc. 
2. If yes, please state the name/names of the third parties? For examples HCA, BUPA,
Spire Healthcare 
3. What category of income does the organisation receive from the third party, please tick
the options that apply in the table below: 

Category of Income Tick Below 
Joint Venture (a commercial arrangement between two or more 
participants) 
Rental of estates or hospital space 
A Profit Share Agreement (an agreement between two or more 
entities who pool resources and agree to split earnings by 
sharing profit on a pre-agreed ratio) 
Payment by Activity (is a form of financing that makes 
payments contingent on results for example number of patients 
treated, number of procedures completed) 
Other (please state) 

Response: 
1. No, The State Hospital does not receive private patient income from third parties.
2. We give notice under section 17 of FOISA that we do not hold the information

requested.
3. We give notice under section 17 of FOISA that we do not hold the information

requested.
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