
Request Reference: FOI/020/22 
Published: 20 September 2022 
 
Information requested: 
 
1. Please can you provide me a list of Hospitals and addresses within your area? 

 
2. Hard FM - (Electrical, mechanical, plumbing maintenance) 
2.a Who is the current provider of Hard Facilities Management across your estate? Or 
perhaps this is managed by an inhouse team? 
2.b If an outsourced provider, when was this contract awarded and what length is the 
contract? Is an extension available? 
2.c If an outsourced provider, when do you expect this contract to come back out to tender? 
2.d If managed inhouse, is there an incumbent supplier supplying electrical products? If so, 
when does this contract expire? 
 
Response:  
 

1 The State Hospital, Lampits Road, Carstairs, Lanark, ML11 8RP. 
 
2a Hard Facilities Management is handled by an in-house team. 
2b We give notice under Section 17 of FOISA that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
2c We give notice under Section 17 of FOISA that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
2d Electrical products are purchased via the Scotland Excel ‘Supply and Delivery of 

Electrical Material 0919’ Framework 
 
Advice and Guidance 
 
In regards to questions 2b and 2c we give notice under The Freedom of Information 
(Scotland) Act 2002 Section 17 that we do not hold any such information as we do not 
outsource our Hard Facilities Management. 
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