
Request Reference: FOI/52/23 
Published: 13 December 2023 
 
Information requested: 
 
1. Since 1st January 2022 how many staff have been given permission to work remotely 

outside of the UK? 
 

2. Please provide a list of each unique approval detailing; country, job title of the individual 
concerned and length of time spent working outside of the UK. 
 

3. Are there any additional associated costs created by staff working outside of the UK. 
Please provide a breakdown of these costs and the total spent since 1st January 2022 

 
Response:  
 
1. Zero. 

 
2. We give notice under FOISA section 17 that we do not hold this information. 
 
3. We give notice under FOISA section 17 that we do not hold this information. 
 


	Information requested:

