
   
    

  

 

    
     

  

   

   

   

 
    

 
 

  
 

 

     

     

     

       
             

Charges

Request Reference: FOI/001/24 
Published: 30 April 2024 

Information requested: 

1. Please provide the total number of patients treated with a non-British national code 
(i.e not White British, Asian British or Black British etc.) for the last three financial 
years, or the last years for which you have statistics. Please also provide the total 
number of patients treated. 

2. What is the total amount in charges you have issued for treatment given to non-UK 
nationals for the last three financial years, or the last three years for which you have 
statistics. What is the amount that you have successfully recovered over the same 
time period? 

3. For both questions I would like the figures for each year, not one figure covering 
all three years. 

Response: 

Year No. of patients 
No. of patients with a non-British 

national code 

2021-2022 130 9 

2022-2023 132 12 

2023-2024 120 10 

Year 
issued for non-UK 
nationals 

(£) 

Charges successfully 
Recovered 

(£) 

2021-2022 0.00 Information not held 

2022-2023 0.00 Information not held 

2023-2024 0.00 Information not held 

As we have not issued any charges for treatment given to non-UK nationals, we give notice 
under section 17 of FOISA that we do not hold information about the recovery of charges. 




