Request Reference: FOI/008/24
Published: 14 May 2024

Information requested:

I would like to request a information regarding Phycho electric wapon ,remote neutral
monitoring and brain control under freedom of Information act 2000.

1.Is the phyco electric wapon and mind control techniques were used by any NHS or NHS
related Care home .?

2.if use please provide details clinic .

Response:

1. We give notice under FOI(S)A section 17 that we do not hold the information requested.
2. We give notice under FOI(S)A section 17 that we do not hold the information requested.

Advice and Guidance
We provided the following guidance on 30 April 2024;

In order for a request to be covered by FOI(S)A, it must, under section 8 of the Act;

a) Be in writing or other permanent form
b) State the name of the applicant and an address for correspondence.
c) Describe the information requested.

Your request does not include your name and therefore it does not meet the criteria to be
covered by FOI(S)A. This may affect your ability to seek further remedies such as an internal
review or an appeal to the Scottish Information Commissioner if you are dissatisfied with our
response to you.

You may wish to consider resubmitting your request with your name included so that it meets
the FOI(S)A criteria.

Although your request isn’t covered by FOI(S)A, we will continue using our FOI process for
your request and will respond in due course.

Further information about making Freedom of Information requests is available from
https://www.itspublicknowledge.info/how-do-i-ask
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