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Information requested:  
 
 
1. Please share data on how many times you or any of your hospitals have reported a 
suspected illegal abortion to Police Scotland between 17/10/2024 to 01/01/2019. 
a. Please can you share this data with me broken down by year. 
b. Please can you provide a breakdown of the incident and the outcome. 
c. Can you please share how many months pregnant the mother was when she miscarried 
d. If possible, can you share whether the pregnancy was terminated through at home abortion 
pills 
 
2. Please share data on how many times you or any of your hospitals have been 
contacted by Police Scotland in regards to a suspected illegal abortion between 17/10/2024 to 
01/01/2019. 
a. Please can you share this data with me broken down by year. 
b. Please can you provide a breakdown of the incident and the outcome. 
c. Can you please share how many months pregnant the mother was when she miscarried 
d. If possible, can you share whether the pregnancy was terminated through at home abortion 
pills 
 
 
Response: 
 
1. The State Hospital is a high secure forensic hospital for male patients. We do not have 

records relating to suspected illegal abortions. 
a) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
b) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
c) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
d) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
 
2. The State Hospital is a high secure forensic hospital for male patients. We do not have 

records relating to suspected illegal abortions. 
a) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
b) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
c) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested. 
d) We give notice under FOISA section 17 that that we do not hold the information 

requested 
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