Request Reference: FOI/038/24
Published: 30 October 2024

Information requested:

I am writing to submit a Freedom of Information request information regarding accidental
injury data from A&E departments on Christmas Day 2023 in your region. Specifically, | would
like to request:

1. Total A+E Admissions on 25/12/23 for your region
Total Accidental Injury Cases Reported in A&E on 25/12/23 for your region (where the
patient was admitted)

3. The Reported Mechanism of Injury for admissions listed as Accidental Injuries on
25/12/23 for your region

Response:

1. The State Hospitals Board for Scotland is a special health board and does not have an
Accident and Emergency department or service. As such we give notice under FOISA
Section 17 that we do not hold the information requested.

2. We give notice under FOISA Section 17 that we do not hold the information requested.

3. We give notice under FOISA Section 17 that we do not hold the information requested.
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