
Request Reference: FOI/060/24 
Published: 17 February 2025 
 
Information requested: 
 
1. Could you please provide the contact details for the procurement officer responsible for 
international recruitment within the trust? For Doctors, Nurses and AHP 
 
2. Outside of Procurement who is the Senior Officer Responsible for International Recruitment 
For Nurse, Doctors, AHP? and their Contaact details? 
 
3. Additionally, what is the budget allocated for international recruitment for the financial year 
2025/26 for Nurse, Doctors, AHP? Who is the responsible officer to allocate this budget? 
 
4. Current  Vacancies at the trust per Specialty: General Nurse/ Mental Health Nurses/ AHP/ 
Doctors 
 
5. During the financial year 2023/24, which international recruitment partners did the trust use, 
if any? Who are they planning to use for 2025/26? Who is the responsible officer who decides 
this? 
 
6. How many international Doctors/Nurse/AHP did the trust receive in the financial year 
2023/24? 
 
7. What was the international recruitment spend Bifurgted by Doctors/Nurses/AHP by the trust 
for the financial year 23/24? 
 
 
Response: 
 
1. The State Hospital does not recruit internationally and therefore we give notice under 

FOISA section 17 that we do not hold the information requested. 
 

2. The State Hospital does not recruit internationally and therefore we give notice under 
FOISA section 17 that we do not hold the information requested. 

 
3. The State Hospital does not recruit internationally and as such there is no budget 

allocation for next financial year. The responsible officers are the Director of Workforce 
and the Director of Nursing and Operations. 

 
4. There was one vacancy at the time of this request; 

 
Specialty: General Nurse/ Mental Health Nurses/ AHP/ Doctors - Team Lead – Arts 
Therapist 

 
5. We did not use any international recruitment partners. We give notice under FOISA 

section 17 that we do not hold information relating to plans to use international recruitment 
partners in 2025/26. The responsible officers are the Director of Workforce and the 
Director of Nursing and Operations. 

 
6. Zero 
  
7. As the State Hospital does not recruit internationally, there was no spend for 2024/25. 
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