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Information requested: 
 
Under FOI, please provide the following by calendar year for 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024, and 
2025. 
 
If you only hold the data by financial year, please provide the data for 2020/2021, 2021/22, 
2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/2025 and 2025 to date. 
 
Please also provide the following data for the past 12 months : 
 
1. Number of suicides in in-patient psychiatric units 
2. Number of suicides per 10,000 in-patient psychiatric admissions 
3. Number of suicides of children and young people under 18 in in-patient psychiatric units 
4.  Number of suicides per 10,000 children and young people under 18 admitted to in-patient 
psychiatric units 
5. Number of suicides within 3 months of being discharged from an in-patient psychiatric unit 
6. Number of suicides per 10,000 discharges from in-patient psychiatric units within 3 months 
of discharge 
7. Number of suicides of children and young people under 18 per 10,000 discharges from in 
patient-psychiatric units within 3 months of discharge 
8. Number of suicides of children and young people under 18 discharged from in patient 
psychiatric units within 3 months of discharge  
 
If less than 10,000 patients have been admitted or discharged in any of these categories, 
please provide the number as another proportion (e.g 1 in 10, 1 in 5436 etc etc). 
 
The term psychiatric unit here refers to any in-patient psychiatric or mental health unit, ward, 
hospital, or other similar institution. 
 
Response: 
 
The State Hospital is a high secure forensic hospital with 140 high-secure beds. Whilst we 
hold information about our patient population, we do not hold information about other services 
or other health boards. 
 
1. For all years, there have been no suicides. 

 
2.   

Year Ratio (admissions) 
2021 0 in 33 
2022 0 in 35 
2023 0 in 21 
2024 0 in 32 
2025 to date 0 in 14 

 
3. For all years, we give notice that do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 

17) 
4. For all years, we give notice that do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 

17) 
5. For all years, we give notice that do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 

17) 
6. For all years, we give notice that do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 

17) 
7. For all years, we give notice that do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 

17) 
For all years, we give notice that do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 17) 



Advice and Guidance: 
 
Psychiatric care in Scotland is generally provided by the patient’s territorial health board. You 
may wish to ask the boards for the information for their areas. It may be the case that some of 
the information sought is held be Public Health Scotland. You can find the FOI contact details 
for each board here: https://www.nhsinform.scot/freedom-of-information-foi/ 

 
 

https://www.nhsinform.scot/freedom-of-information-foi/

	Information requested:
	Response:

