Reference Number: FOI/034/25
Date Published: 09 September 2025

Information requested:

Please answer the following questions:

1. Are the Fire Dampers currently on contract for the inspection and maintenance?

N

If yes, please confirm the following:
Due date for contract end
Actual contract spend

3. What route to market used to obtain these services (a) open tender (b) framework - if
yes, which one?

4. Are the fire dampers currently maintained by an external contractor? If yes, please
provide which contractor?

5. Finally, please advise names and contact details of any individuals (outside of
procurement) responsible for this contract including your Estates Manager (b) Health &
Safety Compliance Manager (c) Fire Officer?

Response:

1. No, Fire Dampers are inspected and maintained by our in-house Estates Team via the
Planned Maintenance System.

2. We give notice that we do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 17)
3. We give notice that we do not hold the information requested. (FOISA section 17)
4. No.

5. We do not have a contract for these services and as such we give notice that we do not
hold information about those that are responsible for the contract. (FOSIA scetion17)

The best contact for these services is:

Kenny Andress

Head of Estates & Facilities
The State Hospital
Carstairs

Lanark

ML11 8RP

Tel: 01555 842162



