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Information requested: 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please provide for your Bank workforce for FY 
2024/25 (or the most recent 12 months): 

1. Do you outsource payroll for Bank workers? If yes, name of provider. 
2. Your fee model for Bank payroll (e.g., per payslip, per hours processed, per timesheet, % 

of gross pay). 
3. The fee level actually paid (e.g., £ per payslip / £ per hour / £ per timesheet / %). 
4. Average number of Bank payslips per pay period and pay frequency (weekly/monthly). 
5. Any additional charges (off-cycle payments, corrections, pension retros, RTI re-

submissions). 
6. If Bank payroll is delivered in-house, please confirm your internal cost per payslip (or 

best estimate) for Bank staff. Please provide any available contract end dates. 
 

Response: 

1. Yes. NHS Greater Glasgow and Clyde  
2. We do not hold this information (FOISA S17) 
3. We do not hold this information (FOISA S17) 
4. 17 per month – monthly paid;  14 per week – weekly paid 
5. Total annual fixed charge for all payroll services– no additional charges 
6. Not applicable. 
 

 




